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Intermediate result for manuscript no:2024/AJAAR/113365

Dari: Managing Editor (editor.sciencedomain65a@gmail.com)

Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Jumat, 9 Februari 2024 20.16 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu, 
 
Kindly note that your manuscript (2024/AJAAR/113365) is under peer review. We are in constant touch with our
reviewers to complete the review in time.
                 
Once we get all the review comments, we shall communicate you (as soon as possible).
 
Thank you for your patience and cooperation.
 
Thank you for your interest in this journal.
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal editorial office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tele: +91 8617752708
UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-003-NRK
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Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We would be happy to receive your revised paper

Dari: Akas Pinaringan (pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id)

Kepada: sdi.3@sciencedomain.org

Tanggal: Jumat, 16 Februari 2024 18.23 GMT+8

Dear MS Ruma Bag
I resubmit the corrected article as per peer review correction.
Thank you

Regards
Akas Pinaringan SUjalu

Pada Jumat, 16 Februari 2024 16.51.04 GMT+8, Editor PRM 3 <sdi.3@sciencedomain.org> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

 
Thank you for your mail. Please visit the link for publication
charge: https://journalajaar.com/index.php/AJAAR/publication-charge

After final publication you will get DOI as well.

We would be happy to receive your revised paper version 1 with the feedback against the reviewers'
comments.
 
Please send us the revised version along with feedback via E-mail attachment in reply mail.
 
Thank you for your interest in this journal.
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal editorial office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91
9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708
UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
EMP-003-DS

On Fri, Feb 16, 2024 at 12:33 AM Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id> wrote:

Dear EiC PRM3
1. How much to pay, and when to publish the article after the APC is paid.
2. Whether to get a DOI
I'm waiting you information
tahnk you

regards
Akas Pinaringan SUjalu

Pada Kamis, 15 Februari 2024 20.56.11 GMT+8, Editor PRM 3 <sdi.3@sciencedomain.org> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,
 
We have sent you an important communication/files related to peer review & manuscript
processing. Please check your inbox/bulk folder/junk folder etc. carefully. If you have not received
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the files/email, please contact us immediately. 
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Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tele: +91 8617752708
UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
 
EMP-003-PP



2/23/24, 11:54 AM Yahoo Mail - Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We would be happy to receive your revised paper

about:blank 1/2

Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We would be happy to receive your revised paper

Dari: Akas Pinaringan (pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id)

Kepada: sdi.3@sciencedomain.org

Tanggal: Jumat, 16 Februari 2024 18.23 GMT+8

Dear MS Ruma Bag
I resubmit the corrected article as per peer review correction.
Thank you

Regards
Akas Pinaringan SUjalu

Pada Jumat, 16 Februari 2024 16.51.04 GMT+8, Editor PRM 3 <sdi.3@sciencedomain.org> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

 
Thank you for your mail. Please visit the link for publication
charge: https://journalajaar.com/index.php/AJAAR/publication-charge

After final publication you will get DOI as well.

We would be happy to receive your revised paper version 1 with the feedback against the reviewers'
comments.
 
Please send us the revised version along with feedback via E-mail attachment in reply mail.
 
Thank you for your interest in this journal.
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal editorial office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91
9163821242, WhatsApp: +91 8617752708
UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
EMP-003-DS

On Fri, Feb 16, 2024 at 12:33 AM Akas Pinaringan <pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id> wrote:

Dear EiC PRM3
1. How much to pay, and when to publish the article after the APC is paid.
2. Whether to get a DOI
I'm waiting you information
tahnk you

regards
Akas Pinaringan SUjalu

Pada Kamis, 15 Februari 2024 20.56.11 GMT+8, Editor PRM 3 <sdi.3@sciencedomain.org> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,
 
We have sent you an important communication/files related to peer review & manuscript
processing. Please check your inbox/bulk folder/junk folder etc. carefully. If you have not received

https://journalajaar.com/index.php/AJAAR/publication-charge
mailto:pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id
mailto:sdi.3@sciencedomain.org


2/23/24, 11:54 AM Yahoo Mail - Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We would be happy to receive your revised paper

about:blank 2/2

Rev_AJAAR_113365_Nic_A (1).doc
253.5kB

the files/email, please contact us immediately. 
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal editorial office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tele: +91 8617752708
UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
 
EMP-003-PP



2/23/24, 11:53 AM Yahoo Mail - Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We hereby acknowledge the receipt of the revised paper

about:blank 1/2

Re: 2024/AJAAR/113365: We hereby acknowledge the receipt of the revised paper

Dari: Editor PRM 3 (sdi.3@sciencedomain.org)

Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Sabtu, 17 Februari 2024 15.31 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu,

Thank you for your mail and attachments. We hereby acknowledge the receipt of the revised paper and duly filled
review forms. The paper is under final evaluation now and we'll let you know the final decision very soon.

Thank you for your interest in this journal.

With Best Regards

Ms. Ruma Bag

Journal editorial office

Reg. Offices:

India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242,
WhatsApp: +91 8617752708

UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
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Final Decision for Manuscript Number: 2024/AJAAR/113365

Dari: Managing Editor-2 (sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk)

Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Kamis, 22 Februari 2024 21.21 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu ,
 
We are delighted to inform you that the Editor of this journal has accepted your following paper for publication.
 
Manuscript number: 2024/AJAAR/113365
 
Title: “THE CLIMATE CONSIDERATIONS IN REVITALIZING AGRICULTURAL SECTOR IN THE PROVINCE OF
EAST KALIMANTAN”   
 
Journal name: Asian Journal of Advances in Agricultural Research
 
Kindly complete the payment formalities so that we can proceed for publication of your paper.
 
Option 1:-
Please complete the payment (E-Journal price) using the link:
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
 
The normal Publication charge is 500 USD. We are pleased to inform you are eligible for a 93% discount. Therefore
you need to pay USD 35.
 
Please select: “01.E-journal price (93% discount) $35.00”
 
Kindly note that this charge includes both E-Journal price and publication charge. There is no separate
publication charge.
 
OPTION 2 (NOT MANDATORY)
 
Are you interested in ordering a Black and White journal hard copy?
 
If you order your journal copy now, you’ll get a 47% discount on the price of the Journal copy.
 
Therefore one journal copy will cost only USD37 (Original price USD70). For this case please select
 
 “02. E-journal price (93% discount) $35.00 + One Journal hard copy charge (47% discount) $37”.
 
Note:
 
Additional Article Reprints and journal copies can be ordered also. Commercial reprints (with colour cover page),
colored reprints or colored Journal Copy can also be ordered separately.
 
Please follow the below steps to complete the payment formalities via credit card-
 
Step1. Please click on: https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
OR
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-00-one-journal-hard-copy-charge-47-discount-37-72-
hrm/
 
Step2. Click on "PayPal"
Step3. Log in to your PayPal account.
Step4. Click on "Pay with Credit Card"
Step5. Please fill up all the necessary details with the manuscript number.
Step6. Click on "Pay now" and complete the payment.
  
Special Note: 
 

https://journalajaar.com/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
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1) If you want to pay the requested amount through email id then please send the payment to our following valid
PayPal registered email: help@sciencedomain.org
 
Please do not pay to any other email id.
 
2) Please always use international credit card for the payment. Please don't use debit card.
 
This mail has been sent from the following 4 emails to avoid email delivery failure:

1. editor.accounts2@sciencedomain.org

2. sdi.2@sciencedomain.info

3. sdi.2@sciencedomain.in

4. sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk

 
One line acknowledgement will be highly appreciated. Should you need any assistance please do not hesitate
to contact us. We’ll be happy to help you.
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242,
WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-MP
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mailto:editor.accounts2@sciencedomain.org
mailto:sdi.2@sciencedomain.info
http://sdi.2@sciencedomain.in/


2/23/24, 11:36 AM Yahoo Mail - Final Decision for Manuscript Number: 2024/AJAAR/113365

about:blank 1/2

Final Decision for Manuscript Number: 2024/AJAAR/113365

Dari: Managing Editor-2 (sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk)

Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Kamis, 22 Februari 2024 21.21 GMT+8

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu ,
 
We are delighted to inform you that the Editor of this journal has accepted your following paper for publication.
 
Manuscript number: 2024/AJAAR/113365
 
Title: “THE CLIMATE CONSIDERATIONS IN REVITALIZING AGRICULTURAL SECTOR IN THE PROVINCE OF
EAST KALIMANTAN”   
 
Journal name: Asian Journal of Advances in Agricultural Research
 
Kindly complete the payment formalities so that we can proceed for publication of your paper.
 
Option 1:-
Please complete the payment (E-Journal price) using the link:
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
 
The normal Publication charge is 500 USD. We are pleased to inform you are eligible for a 93% discount. Therefore
you need to pay USD 35.
 
Please select: “01.E-journal price (93% discount) $35.00”
 
Kindly note that this charge includes both E-Journal price and publication charge. There is no separate
publication charge.
 
OPTION 2 (NOT MANDATORY)
 
Are you interested in ordering a Black and White journal hard copy?
 
If you order your journal copy now, you’ll get a 47% discount on the price of the Journal copy.
 
Therefore one journal copy will cost only USD37 (Original price USD70). For this case please select
 
 “02. E-journal price (93% discount) $35.00 + One Journal hard copy charge (47% discount) $37”.
 
Note:
 
Additional Article Reprints and journal copies can be ordered also. Commercial reprints (with colour cover page),
colored reprints or colored Journal Copy can also be ordered separately.
 
Please follow the below steps to complete the payment formalities via credit card-
 
Step1. Please click on: https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
OR
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-00-one-journal-hard-copy-charge-47-discount-37-72-
hrm/
 
Step2. Click on "PayPal"
Step3. Log in to your PayPal account.
Step4. Click on "Pay with Credit Card"
Step5. Please fill up all the necessary details with the manuscript number.
Step6. Click on "Pay now" and complete the payment.
  
Special Note: 
 

https://journalajaar.com/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-00-one-journal-hard-copy-charge-47-discount-37-72-hrm/


2/23/24, 11:36 AM Yahoo Mail - Final Decision for Manuscript Number: 2024/AJAAR/113365

about:blank 2/2

1) If you want to pay the requested amount through email id then please send the payment to our following valid
PayPal registered email: help@sciencedomain.org
 
Please do not pay to any other email id.
 
2) Please always use international credit card for the payment. Please don't use debit card.
 
This mail has been sent from the following 4 emails to avoid email delivery failure:

1. editor.accounts2@sciencedomain.org

2. sdi.2@sciencedomain.info

3. sdi.2@sciencedomain.in

4. sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk

 
One line acknowledgement will be highly appreciated. Should you need any assistance please do not hesitate
to contact us. We’ll be happy to help you.
 
With Best Regards
Ms. Ruma Bag
 
Journal Editorial Office
Reg. Offices:
India: Guest House Road, Street no - 1/6, Hooghly, West Bengal, India, Tel: +91 8617752708 | +91 9163821242,
WhatsApp: +91 8617752708, UK: Third Floor, 207 Regent Street, London, W1B 3HH, UK, Fax: +44 20-3031-1429
 
EMP-007-MP

mailto:editor.15@sciencedomain.org
mailto:editor.accounts2@sciencedomain.org
mailto:sdi.2@sciencedomain.info
http://sdi.2@sciencedomain.in/


2/23/24, 12:23 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: Request for payment regarding Manuscript Number : 2024/AJAAR/113365

about:blank 1/3

Re: Request for payment regarding Manuscript Number : 2024/AJAAR/113365

Dari: Akas Pinaringan (pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id)

Kepada: sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk

Tanggal: Jumat, 23 Februari 2024 11.25 GMT+8

I have completed the payment for Manuscript Number: 2024/AJAAR/113365 via PayPal
thank you

regards
Akas PS

Pada Kamis, 22 Februari 2024 21.22.34 GMT+8, Managing Editor-2 <sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akas Pinaringan Sujalu ,
 
We are delighted to inform you that the Editor of this journal has accepted your following
paper for publication.
 
Manuscript number: 2024/AJAAR/113365
 
Title: “THE CLIMATE CONSIDERATIONS IN REVITALIZING AGRICULTURAL SECTOR
IN THE PROVINCE OF EAST KALIMANTAN”   
 
Journal name: Asian Journal of Advances in Agricultural Research
 
Kindly complete the payment formalities so that we can proceed for publication of
your paper.
 
Option 1:-
Please complete the payment (E-Journal price) using the link:
https://www.sciencedomain.in/ e-journal-price-93-discount- 35-hrm/
 
The normal Publication charge is 500 USD. We are pleased to inform you are eligible for a
93% discount. Therefore you need to pay USD 35.
 
Please select: “01.E-journal price (93% discount) $35.00”
 
Kindly note that this charge includes both E-Journal price and publication charge.
There is no separate publication charge.
 
OPTION 2 (NOT MANDATORY)
 
Are you interested in ordering a Black and White journal hard copy?
 
If you order your journal copy now, you’ll get a 47% discount on the price of the Journal
copy.
 
Therefore one journal copy will cost only USD37  (Original price USD70). For this case
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OR
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charge-47-discount-37-72-hrm/
 
Step2. Click on "PayPal"
Step3. Log in to your PayPal account.
Step4. Click on "Pay with Credit Card"
Step5. Please fill up all the necessary details with the manuscript number.
Step6. Click on "Pay now" and complete the payment.
  
Special Note: 
 
1) If you want to pay the requested amount through email id then please send the payment
to our following valid PayPal registered email: help@sciencedomain.org
 
Please do not pay to any other email id.
 
2) Please always use international credit card for the payment. Please don't use debit card.
 
This mail has been sent from the following 4 emails to avoid email delivery failure:
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EMP-007-MP

https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-hrm/
https://www.sciencedomain.in/e-journal-price-93-discount-35-00-one-journal-hard-copy-charge-47-discount-37-72-hrm/
mailto:editor.15@sciencedomain.org
mailto:editor.accounts2@sciencedomain.org
mailto:sdi.2@sciencedomain.info
http://sdi.2@sciencedomain.in/
http://sdi.2@sciencedomain.uk/


2/23/24, 12:23 PM Yahoo Mail - Re: Request for payment regarding Manuscript Number : 2024/AJAAR/113365

about:blank 3/3

E-journal price (93% discount) $35 – SCIENCEDOMAIN international.pdf
99.5kB



2/24/24, 4:35 AM Yahoo Mail - Acceptance letter for manuscript number:2024/AJAAR/113365

about:blank 1/1

Acceptance letter for manuscript number:2024/AJAAR/113365

Dari: Managing Editor (acceptance@sciencedomain.info)

Kepada: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Tanggal: Jumat, 23 Februari 2024 20.53 GMT+8

Dear Colleague,,

We acknowledge the receipt of Article Publication charge for your manuscript.

2024/AJAAR/113365

Please follow the below mentioned link to access your “Acceptance Letter”

Please do not give <space> after write your email ID

Login URL: https://dashboard.peerreviewcentral.com

Username: pinaringan_b@yahoo.co.id

Password: gcROoV2uFjiL

 

Please see the below help video guideline:
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